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Call Order 001 (DD00356)
DATE AND TIME OF BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 22, 2022 AT 2:00 PM CONTRACT ID: DD00356 WBS ELEMENT NO.:
BP4.R004.3 FEDERAL AID NO.: STATE FUNDED COUNTY: EDGECOMBE COUNTY TIP NO.: N/A MILES: 0.095 MILES
ROUTE NO.: SR 1124 LOCATION: BRIDGE 29 OVER CORN CREEK TYPE OF WORK: GRADING, DRAINAGE, PAVING
AND CULVERT

$877,020.10 5072 SNC02186809 FSC II LLC DBA FRED SMITH COMPANY
$953,426.51 1983 BD87-9784-B419-9364 MOUNTAIN CREEK CONTRACTORS INC

$1,186,954.38 3752 6810-443A-0817-4D63 TRIANGLE GRADING & PAVING INC

Call Order 002 (DD00357)
DATE AND TIME OF BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 22, 2022 AT 2:00 PM CONTRACT ID: DD00357 WBS ELEMENT NO.:
BP4.R005.3 FEDERAL AID NO.: STATE FUNDED COUNTY: EDGECOMBE COUNTY TIP NO.: N/A MILES: 0.112 MILES
ROUTE NO.: SR 1526 LOCATION: BRIDGE 78 OVER BALLAHACK CANAL TYPE OF WORK: GRADING, DRAINAGE,
PAVING AND CULVERT

$1,016,440.45 5072 SNC02187714 FSC II LLC DBA FRED SMITH COMPANY
$1,063,270.06 1983 C87E-7A01-7CBC-6A73 MOUNTAIN CREEK CONTRACTORS INC
$1,532,453.82 3752 5E4B-E160-EA68-4506 TRIANGLE GRADING & PAVING INC

Call Order 003 (DD00367)
DATE AND TIME OF BID OPENING: FEBRUARY 22, 2022 AT 2:00 PM CONTRACT ID: DD00367 WBS ELEMENT NO.:
44914.3.21 FEDERAL AID NO.: 0406011 COUNTY: JOHNSTON COUNTY TIP NO.: R-5784EA ROUTE NO.: VARIOUS
LOCATION: VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN CLAYTON TYPE OF WORK: MISC. CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION

$121,350.00 11462 No Bid Bond ID WHITLEY CONTRACTING INC
$132,700.00 3304 No Bid Bond ID FULFORD AND JONES ASPHALT INC

$135,175.00 11766 No Bid Bond ID
EASTERN EARTHSCAPES & CONSTRUCTION
LLC

$162,625.00 2653 No Bid Bond ID BROWE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
$195,875.00 11294 No Bid Bond ID HOLLINS CONSTRUCTION SERVICES INC
$219,850.00 15812 No Bid Bond ID JYMCO CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC
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ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - $842,231.75

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - $885,616.25

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - $150,550.00


